R710. Public Safety, Fire Marshal. Final Draft
R710-9. Rules Pursuant to the Utah Fire Prevention Law.
R710-9-1. Title, Authority, and Adoption of Codes.

1.1 These rules shall be known as the "Rules Pursuant to the Utah Fire Prevention

Law", and may be cited as such, and will be hereafter referred to as "these rules".

1.2 These rules are promulgated in accordance with Title 53, Chapter 7, Section
204, Utah Code Annotated 1953, as amended.

1.3 These rules are adopted by the Utah Fire Prevention Board to provide minimum
rules for safeguarding life and property from the hazards of fire and explosion, for
board meeting conduct, procedures to amend incorporated references, establishing
amendments and additions to the adopted codes, establishing board subcommittees,
enforcement of the rules of the State Fire Marshal, and deputizing Special Deputy State
Fire Marshals.

1.4 There is adopted as part of these rules the following code which is
incorporated by reference:

1.4.1 International Fire Code (IFC), [2666] 2009 edition, excluding appendices,
as promulgated by the International Code Council, Inc., except as amended by provisions
listed in R710-9-6, et seq.

[+= Ml eaan - -

fa)

I A R -] e on R o i AL Reat A= k] k]
TITCCIrIIacroiar rrrec cotcy UU0 COIrCcIoll, Clagpter 3FJ; helorcllced octallaarasy; dos ITOLIOWS.
h=y

4 1 N e o 1o = — 2, L AR NFRRA 1N <y k] 1 kY el
T.J. L NacrIollar rrre rrocccCcrIolr 7t OCTIacIolr (NCrzy), INCrzy rU, ocaliaarca ror rorcaore
I e o L el la¥WaVala] Ja4 . Jodl 1 Lo 1o o noan_ o
TIrS LOXCINgUISICrSy UU 7T COICTIoll,; C©XCTPT aoS damcerioca Oy pProvISIOIS Trrsctoeo IIf N7 LU O, <©C
1 C N e o k] T kY = — 2 (P AR NRRA 12 <y k] k] =
T.J-. NacrIoiar TITrT TITOCCCCIOIr IISSOCTIacrIolr VINCTZY) 7 N L7y IOy oCalraara TOTL
T _—1 o £ o (R . | a = laWaWallal Ja4 = a1 Lo 1 e ol
TIISCTaOLILTAaCIOIl OL OPIrIIIRICL OySColSy IYAY) TOICIOI,; C©XCTPTt oo amctioca Oy ProvISIoisS rrosceda
3 no1n Qg =
TIT IN7 LU U7, ©C oScd-.
4 C 1 N e o R kY = — 2, (P AR NP 1N i k] 1 o
ToIJ.90 NacIollar T Irce TrroccCCIolr zt oCcTIacrotr \Nrrzy), NCTLzix IOUD, ocalraara ror  clc
T _—1 o £ o (R . | a 4 s ]l m = ] Y 13- 1 ng £ 4 1 11
TIISCTarLracIoll OL OpPrIIIRIcr O Tt TIT TS alta Iwo ramrty DwelTltllg arrTr rianuraccuarea nomesSy
faVWala] Ja4 4 Jadl 1 (D] b DI no1n Qg =
A% TOICIOI,;, C©XCTPC as amclroca Oy ProviISTIOoNS TIsctea IiT N7 LU U7, ©C oScd-
4 C 4 N e o R kY = — 2, (P AR NP 120 <y k] k] o
ToJ. % NacIollar T Irce TrrocceCCIolr zt oOCTIacIolr \Nrrzy), NCTLZy IO, wocargara ror  clc
T _—1 o a 1 a = : n (DR} — 3 = 3 . k] 1. -
TIISTaITAaCcIOoll O OPrIIIRIcr oOySCols IiI heorIaclicrar vctupaticres up  Cto  alia rhncecroarlilg rour
<y 3 s b2 S fa¥aVala] NI . Jodl 1 P o b AP B RI1A
OCOLrITCS ITII T IgIIc, UU 7T COUrICIOl, CTXCTpPpCt as amceroca O ProvVISTIOIIS rrSteda it N7 TU O, <©C
1 C Ao R kY = — 2 (P AR NFRRA TN Nt R ] 4
ToT.J NacIollar T Irc T TITOCCCCIOIr osoCTIactolr \INCrzy)jy INCLZY Uy DNaclotflar LIcCCrrIc
k] 2000 I k] I ) o Tlea s £ R 1 3o i 1 1 D ma g 7 Qo Sla =
ooy UU0 COUrCcIoll; o aouopTteT O CIIC U ILOrM Durrarlllyg ocataara ICC, IICTIc JO. Tapcter
O
e o 3 — oo ——la ] : o Tt e R - S T oo d
WIIcrever Clicre IS o Sccortrolr, rLrgurce or ctabrc Iir Clre IlIcerlracrolrar rrrce couc (LIfro) Cclirac
£ nToo oo P k] Sa ol oo d £ R 1 k1 k] LN TR ¢ S k]
TETTIrerces TCC Lorectrrecar oo ClIac Trorcrcotice Tarrt  Pc  ropraccea  wICcll NacrIolar
=1 I e d ol
TTCCTrrc CcotT .
1 C N e o R~ kY = — 2, L AR NP 09 At R - 27
T.J.0 NaCcIollar rIrc rrocecCcrolr zx OCTIaCIOIr \INCLZzy)y IND LZY 7 Nacrotflar rIrc zzrari
k] fa¥WaVala] I = I ] (D] 1 e o no1n 4
ooy \PAV) CTOICIOI,; C©XCTPC as amcelraca Il ProvisSIolirsS rTIsctcea IiT N/ LU U7, ©C Scd-
T e B \. S 3 o kY 4 — 2 (P AR NFRRA 1N I oI D]
T.J-. NgCIolar rrIrc TrroctcCCIoll IosSoCcracrIolr (Nrrzy), NLTLzx TuUl, LIrc oarcty Coucy
an Ja4 4 locl o s k] NI no1n Qg " Tl o
UU0 CCOICIOIr,; C©XCTPC aos amenaca Iif ProvIsSIolr TIScoa TII IN7 LU O, ©C oSood- wWIerever clcore
3 e y=Xi el : NFRRA 101 oo d = [IECEnEat InlfaWaVal n 14
IS & ScCCtIolry, Trgurc or caore Iit INCrzy  TOUT ClIac rcrorolices INTC Lzt JUUU DU ITCOrIrg

oo
\wiwi
e I o L S R - h=y i A 2 L MDA MNERA 1 N e k] 1l a1
T.J.0 NgCIoftar rIrc rroccCTIoIT 7t oCIaCcIoIr (NCrzy), NCrzx LTOU, ocaiaarca ror rrIamc
mec = Rt 1 faWaVa) R = ool : : 1o R71A
TTTICCCTS DTrLorc all naarcricey, UU0 COUIrCcIoll, T©XCTPCt o ameroca O ProvVISTIOIT TrSTCC IIr IN7T LU

1.[614.2 National Fire Protection Association (NFPA), NFPA 96, Standard for
Ventilation Control and Fire Protection of Commercial Cooking Operations, 2008 edition,
except as amended by provisions listed in R710-9-6, et seq.

R710-9-2. Definitions.
2.1 T"Appreciable Depth" means a depth greater than 1/4 inch.



2.2 "Authority Having Jurisdiction (AHJ)" means the State Fire Marshal, his
authorized deputies, or the local fire enforcement authority.

2.3 "Board" means Utah Fire Prevention Board.

2.4 "Division" means State Fire Marshal.

2.5 "ICC" means International Code Council, Inc.

2.6 "IFC" means International Fire Code.

2.7 "Institutional occupancy" means asylums, mental hospitals, hospitals,

sanitariums, homes for the aged, residential health care facilities, children's homes or
institutions, or any similar institutional occupancy.

2.8 "LFA" means Local Fire Authority.

2.9 "NFPA" means National Fire Protection Association.

2.10 "Place of assembly" means where 50 or more people gather together in a
building, structure, tent, or zroom for the purpose of amusement, entertainment,
instruction, or education.

2.11 "SFM" means State Fire Marshal or authorized deputy.

2.12 "Sub-Committee" means Fire Prevention Board Budget Sub-Committee or Amendment
Sub-Committee.

2.13 “UAC” means Utah Administrative Code.

2.[+3]14 "UCA" means Utah Code Annotated, 1953.

2.15 “UL” means Underwriters Laboratories, Inc.

R710-9-3. Conduct of Board Members and Board Meetings.

3.1 Board meetings shall be presided over and conducted by the chairman and in
his absence the vice chairman or the chairman's designee.

3.2 A quorum shall be required to approve any action of the Board.

3.3 The chairman of the Board and Board members shall be entitled to vote on all
issues considered by the Board. A Board member who declares a conflict of interest or
where a conflict of interest has been determined, shall not vote on that particular
issue.

3.4 Meetings of the Board shall be conducted in accordance with an agenda, which
shall be submitted to the members by the division, not less that 21 days before the
regularly scheduled Board meetings.

3.5 Public notice of Board meetings shall be made by the Division as prescribed
in UCA Section 52-4-6.

3.6 The division shall provide the Board with a secretary who shall prepare
minutes and shall perform all secretarial duties necessary for the Board to fulfill its
responsibility. The minutes of Board meetings shall be completed and sent to Board
members at least 14 days prior to the scheduled Board meeting.

3.7 A Board members standing on the Board shall come under review after two
unexcused absences in one year from regularly scheduled board meetings. The Board
members name shall be submitted to the governors office for status review.

R710-9-4. Deputizing Persons to Act as Special Deputy State Fire Marshals.

4.1 Special deputy state fire marshals may be appointed by the SFM to positions
of expertise within the regular scope of the Fire Marshal's Office.

4.2 Pursuant to Section 53-7-101 et seq., special deputy state fire marshals may
also be appointed to assist the Fire Marshal's Office in establishing and maintaining
minimum fire prevention standards in those occupancy classifications listed in the
International Fire Code.

4.3 Special deputy state fire marshals shall be appointed after review by the
State Fire Marshal in regard to their qualifications and the overall benefit to the
Office of the State Fire Marshal.

4.4 Special deputy state fire marshals shall be appointed by completing an oath
and shall be appointed for a specific period of time.

4.5 Special deputy state fire marshals shall have a picture identification card
and shall carry that card when performing their assigned duties.



R710-9-5. Procedures to Amend the International Fire Code.

5.1 All requests for amendments to the IFC shall be submitted to the division on
forms created by the division, for presentation to the Board at the next regularly
scheduled Board meeting.

5.2 Requests for amendments received by the division less than 21 days prior to
any regularly scheduled meeting of the Board may be delayed in presentation until the
next regularly scheduled Board meeting.

5.3 Upon presentation of a proposed amendment, the Board shall do one of the
following:

5.3.1 accept the proposed amendment as submitted or as modified by the Board;

5.3.2 reject the proposed amendment;

5.3.3 submit the proposed amendment to the Board Amendment Subcommittee for
further study; or

5.3.4 return the proposed amendment to the requesting agency, accompanied by
Board comments, allowing the requesting agency to resubmit the proposed amendment with
modifications.

5.4 The Board Amendment Subcommittee shall report its recommendation to the Board
at the next regularly scheduled Board meeting.

5.5 The Board shall make a final decision on the proposed amendment at the next
Board meeting following the original submission.

5.6 The Board may reconsider any request for amendment, reverse or modify any
previous action by majority vote.

5.7 When approved by the Board, the requesting agency shall provide to the
division within 45 days, the completed ordinance.

5.8 The division shall maintain a list of amendments to the IFC that have been
granted by the Board.

5.9 The division shall make available to any person or agency copies of the
approved amendments upon request, and may charge a reasonable fee for multiple copies in
accordance with the provisions of UCA, 63-2-203.

R710-9-6. Amendments and Additions.

The following amendments and additions are hereby adopted by the Board for
application statewide:

6.1 International Fire Code - Scope and Administration

6.1.1 IFC, Chapter 1, Section 105.6.16, Flammable and combustible ligquids, is
amended to add the following section: [+F*]12. The owner of an underground tank that is

out of service for longer than one year, shall receive a Temporary Closure Notice from
the Department of Environmental Quality and a copy shall be given to the AHJ.

6.1.2 IFC, Chapter 1, Section 109.2, Notice of wviolation, is amended as follows:
On line three after the words "is in violation of this code," [add—the—fottowing] insert
"or other pertinent laws or ordinances" to the section.

6.2 International Fire Code - Definitions
6.2.1 IFC, Chapter 2, Section 202, General Definitions, Occupancy Classification,

Educational Group E, Day care is amended as follows: On line three delete the word "five"
and replace it with the word "four".
6.2.2 1IFC, Chapter 2, Section 202, General Definitions, Occupancy Classification,

Institutional Group I, Group I-1 is amended to add the following: On line ten add "Type
[£]I" in front of the words "Assisted living facilities".
6.2.3 IFC, Chapter 2 Section 202, General Definitions, Occupancy Classification,

Institutional Group I, Group I-2 is amended as follows: On line [four] three delete the
word " [fiwe] for" and [reprace—tt—with—the—word—three®™] insert the following “on a 24

hour basis of more than three” into the sentence. On line [e*teven] ten after the words

sectiorm;—ard] “Nursing homes” add the

following: "both intermediate nursing care and skilled nursing care facilities,

[A]lambulatory surgical centers with [+wo] five or more operating rooms where care is less

h 24 h = A e 1 k] = [ IR = ) 1o A . 1o 2
than ours, [uut_)_./at_;cut_ MeTIrcar Ccarc LacrrIIctres ror amouractory pPAacIclits (accommodac ity



of—uresststed—setfpreservationy] and Type [Z2]II assisted living facilities. Type [2]II

assisted living facilities with five or fewer persons shall be classified as a Group R-4.

Type [2]II assisted living facilities with at least six and not more than 16 residents
shall be classified as a Group I-1 facility.
6.2.4 IFC, Chapter 2, Section 202, General Definitions, Occupancy Classification,

Institutional Group I, Group I-4, day care facilities, Child care facility is amended as

follows: On line three delete the word "five" and replace it with the word "four". Also
on line two of the Exception delete the word "five" and replace it with the word "four".
2 I T I ok 4 (] fal s [aWa¥a) il hmY = .
2= 7

[U J T \_/J.J.C{)_JL_CJ_ 12 O T TTITUIT \Y) ' oI al DT TITTCTTUITS, \J\_,\_,u)_./au\_,_y

o . s n .l L ul Vol n ha . | | e 1ol el £ 11 . I s
Tado o T T TCTAatTUIT, NCTOoTUTITUTAdT UJ_ULl)_J N T S JITTITUTC T [cywiwy CITT J_UJ_J_UWJ_ll\:j . ) \_/C)_J CTUIT,.

n 1o 1o | s 1.0 l 1o 11 1 il . | n .l .y il
J_)UC{J_\J.J_ll\:j 1TTUTOST S AT TUNNITUUS L_J_ll\:j Eav) LJCJ. 1T oL Ea olTd T T UT CTadoo I TITTU d NCTOoTUTITCUTIT AT \:u_uu)_./
R—3=]

6.2.[6]5 IFC, Chapter 2, Section 202, General Definitions, Occupancy
Classification, Residential Group R, R-2 is amended to add the following: Exception:

Boarding houses accommodating 10 persons or less shall be classified as Residential Group
R-3.

6.3 International Fire Code - General [Preceutiormrs—AgsinstFire] Requirements

6.3.1 IFC, Chapter 3, Section 304.1.2, Vegetation is amended as follows: Delete
[thre—eurrernt] line six and add the following in it’s place: “the Utah Administrative
Code, R652-122-200, Minimum Standards for Wildland Fire Ordinance.”_

6.3.2 IFC, Chapter 3, Section 311.1.1, Abandoned premises is amended as follows:

On line ten delete the words "International Property Maintenance Code and the" from
[tirts] the section.

6.3.3 IFC, Chapter 3, Section 311.5, Placards is amended as follows: On line
[two] three delete the word “shall” and replace it with the word “may”.

6.3.4 IFC, Chapter 3, Section 315.2.1, Ceiling clearance is amended to add the
following: Exception: Where storage is not directly below the sprinkler heads, storage

is allowed to be placed to the ceiling on wall mounted shelves that are protected by fire
sprinkler heads in occupancies meeting classification as light or ordinary hazard.

6.4 International Fire Code - Emergency Planning and Preparedness

6.4.1 IFC, Chapter 4, Section 404.2[«#-], Where required, Subsection 8 is amended
as follows: After the word “buildings” add “to include sororities and fraternity

houses”.

6.5 International Fire Code - Building Services and Systems

6.5.1 IFC, Chapter 6, Section 607.[3]4, Elevator keys is deleted and rewritten as
follows: Firefighter service keys shall be kept in a "Supra - Stor-a-key" elevator key

box or similar box with corresponding key system that is adjacent to the elevator for
immediate use by the fire department. The key box shall contain one key for each
elevator, one key for lobby control, and any other keys necessary for emergency service.
The elevator key box shall be accessed using a 6049 numbered key. All existing elevator
key box locks that do not use the numbered 6049 key shall be changed to the 6049 key by
December 31, 2011.

6.5.2 IFC, Chapter 6, Section 609.1, General is amended to add the following: On
line three after the word "Code" add the words "and NFPA 96".

6.6 International Fire Code - Fire Protection Systems

6.6.1 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 901.2, Construction documents is amended to add the
following at the end of the section: The code official has the authority to request

record drawings ("as builts") to verify any modifications to the previously approved
construction documents.
6.6.2 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 902.1, Definitions, RECORD DRAWINGS is deleted and

rewritten as follows: Drawings ("as builts") that document all aspects of a fire
protection system as installed.

[U. U.3 IFC, Cha)_./th. (\, SC\_/tJI_Ull nOl.U JI_ o.nl\:udcd tU C{L}l\_l thc: fUllUWJ‘_Ll\j- T h =

| . . e . £ o 1 i P lo 11 - el . sy | . s £

UWITTLT UL AT TIT T CLacuoLr UL caclITl UuJ_J.\_A.J.J.l\ﬁ ol T T 1T O Tl J_J.J.DbJCk_, CLTUILT T a4 L_J.J.l\:ﬂ A

= k) k] = A s = : k] : Rl ke I W A | e
wacTtcer oTaSTT TIre ProTteCTIOIT CCItT =} regurrea IIT norT N7 LU Iy nuocofacIcT rIrc



Sprimkter—Systemfaspecting—and—Festing-]

6.6.[%]3 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.2.1.2, Group A-2 is amended to add the
following subsection: 4. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
Group A-2 occupancies where indoor pyrotechnics are used.

6.06.4 TIFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.2.2, Group B ambulatory health care facilities
is amended as follows: On line three delete the words “all fire areas” and replace with
the word “buildings”.

6.6.5 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.2.[3+2r]4, Group F-1, Subsection 2 is deleted
and rewritten as follows: [frere—a] A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three
stories above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access[+—o*].

6.6.6 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.2.[6t2)r]7, Group M, Subsection 2 is deleted and
rewritten as follows: [Wirere—=] A Group M fire area 1is located more than three stories

above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access[+—o®*].

6.6.7 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.2.[#]8 Group R[7] 1is amended to add the
following: Exception: Detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family
dwellings (townhouses) constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code
for one- and two-family dwellings.

6.6.8 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.2.[%#]8, Group R is amended to add [the
fottowimg] a second exception as follows: Exception: Group R-4 fire areas not more than

4500 gross square feet and not containing more than 16 residents, provided the building
is equipped throughout with an approved fire alarm system that is interconnected and
receives its primary power from the building wiring and a commercial power system.

6.6.9 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.2.[8+€2r]9, Group S-1, Subsection 2 is deleted
and rewritten as follows: A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above
the lowest level of fire department vehicle accesst;—or]

6.6.10 TIFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.2.[92]10, Group S-2 enclosed parking garages is
deleted and rewritten as follows: [Growp—S——2=] An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout buildings classified as parking garages in accordance with Section

406.2 of the International Building Code or where located beneath other groups.

6.6.10.1 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.2.10, Group S-2 enclosed parking garages,

Exception [++]_1is deleted and rewritten as follows: Exception: Parking garages of less

than 5,000 square feet (464m2) accessory to Group R-3 occupancies.
6.6.10.2 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.2.10, Group S-2 enclosed parking garages, is

amended to add a second exception, Exception [2]: Open parking garages not located

beneath other groups if one of the following conditions are met:

6.6.10.2.1 [&=] 1. Access 1is provided for fire fighting operations to within 150
feet (45 720mm) of all portions of the parking garage as measured from the approved fire
department vehicle access, or

6.6.10.2.2 [p=] 2. Class I standpipes are installed throughout the parking
garage.

6.6.11 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.2.[9]10.1, Commercial parking garages 1is

deleted and rewritten as follows: [Commeretat—parking—garages~] An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial trucks or
buses._

6.6.12 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.3.5, Water supplies is amended [by—eaddiag—the
fottowing—at—the—end—of—the—section] as follows: [Fhepotabte—water—sSuppiy to automatic
fire—sprinkter—systems—and——standpire——systems—shatt—Peprotected—against—Packftow—in

w On line six after the word “Code” add
Mand as amended in the Utah Administrative Code, R156-56-707, Utah Uniform Building
Standard Act Rules”.

6.6.13 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 903.6, Existing Buildings and Chapter 46, Section

4603.4 Sprinkler systems is amended to add the following subsection[s] to each section:

903.6.[2]3 Group A-2 [oceuparcies] and 4603.4.3 Group A-2. An automatic fire sprinkler

system shall be provided throughout existing Group A-2 occupancies where indoor
pyrotechnics are used.
6.6.14 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 904.11, Commercial cooking systems is deleted and




rewritten as follows: [Commerctat—Cooking—Systems—] The automatic fire extinguishing
system for commercial cooking systems shall be of a type recognized for protection of
commercial cooking equipment and exhaust systems. Pre-engineered automatic extinguishing
systems shall be tested in accordance with UL300 and listed and labeled for the intended
application. The system shall be installed in accordance with this code, its listing and
the manufacturer’s installation instructions. The Exception in Section 904.11 is not
deleted and shall remain as currently written in the IFC.

6.6.15 IFC, Chapter 9, Sections 904.11.3, Carbon dioxide systems and 904.11.3.1,
Ventilation system is deleted and rewritten as follows:

6.6.15.1 Existing automatic fire extinguishing systems used for commercial
cooking that use dry chemical [+s] are prohibited and shall be removed from service.

6.6.15.2 Existing wet chemical fire extinguishing systems used for commercial
cooking that are not UL300 listed and labeled are prohibited and shall be either removed
or upgraded to a UL300 listed and labeled system.

6.6.16 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 904.11.4, Special provisions for automatic

sprinkler systems 1is amended to add the following subsection: 904.11.4.2 Existing

automatic fire sprinkler systems protecting commercial cooking equipment, hood, and
exhaust systems that generate appreciable depth of cooking oils shall be replaced with a
UL300 system that is listed and labeled for the intended application.

6.6.17 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 904.11.6.[4]2, Extingquishing system service 1is

amended to add the following: Exception: Automatic fire extinguishing systems located in
occupancies where usage is limited and less than six consecutive months, may be serviced
annually if the annual service is conducted immediately before the period of usage, and
approval is received from the AHJ.

6.6.18 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 905.11, Existing buildings and Chapter 46, Section
4603.5 Standpipes 1is deleted.

10 bk pal Ala = fal a i fa Walor BT SR Yo N N a1 yal 1
[U.U.J_ TrCy ClIapcer 2 OCCCITOIT U7.Z2-.1TU.L.3 TS Crocactca dos TLOITOWS. TarooIT
s 1 yal ) (DR} 1 R s N : 1 k] R S A 1 k] k] £
MOMTOXTOC arIarits .  Caroolr MonNoxXTroac ararllr STIar L T IlIsctarrca ol cacll lraprrtapre rtover or o
k] 13- . k] s (. : R R D4 3 k] el o k]
TweTITIIlrg ullrc ©Or SIcoprllg ullrtc Iir oroups I 7 N Oy In 4, dailaa T T cgurppTa wrclr rucrk
1 3 1.
OUrITIng apprratices.
laWa T Al = fa a — Qa7 2 1 5 o Jadd a1 1.
U.0.2U Troy; Cllapcer 7 OCCCIOIT U7 .Z2.LTU. IS amcroca ads LOLIIToOwS OIT T Iflc CwWoy
1. oo 3 1. i ) i o RN leatl Jod ot adl
TIIe Lrve, Jdlia rrlrec olc oL Ctlile LXCTPCIolly; Cllc WOTrd SMORT ENCINVIS RS S iv
o] T Ala = fa a — o WaXar BTSSR Yo W SN Jadl a1 3 4 3
\rme) T TrC, Cllapcer 7 OCCCIOIT U7 .Z2.ITU.0 IS amnctioca ads LOILIToOwS OIT T Ifrc Ctwo alra
1. =i o SER\N leall o Jod ot odl 1= : =y o 1 w7 W74 1 i
TIIe rIve, Cllc wora STMORT T (SiSEaSauSiv N OIT T I IIrlrc arcer Cclile wora cTrosTca ;, aod  clc
£ 3 4 N p ] Jos g ] 1 1 2 Jord 4 GNP B )
TOTITOWIITY cITcence . NPProved COMOINIaCc IOl SMORT  dallid  Carpoolr MONTOXTICOT UCCeCtorS Tar . oT
29 T = fa a — Qa7 2 1N a4 o Jadd a1 1.
. 0. Tro Cliapcer 7 OCCCIOIT U7 .2.TU.3 TIo amnclioca adS IOLIIOWS OIT TIrre T rve

6.6.[23]19 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 907.3, Where required in existing buildings and

structures is deleted and Chapter 46, Section 4603.6 Fire alarm systems is deleted in its

entirety and rewritten as follows: An approved automatic fire detection system shall be
installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72. Devices,
combinations of devices, appliances and equipment shall be approved. The automatic fire
detectors shall be smoke detectors, except an approved alternative type of detector shall
be installed in spaces such as boiler rooms where, during normal operation, products of
combustion are present in sufficient quantity to actuate a smoke detector.

fa W] T o e Ia) e o Wa Ve B W faWaler o W N QA o 1 o faWaler o W M
[U.U. 3 TrCy CrIapcter 7 OCCCIOIT U7 .90. Ly U7 .9.L.Ly U7 0. L:27 U7 9. L.97
Q e B} 1 et ol
T O~ TCCCO

T
R | : 3 = ] k] i = 1o N1}
mMUorcrpre SIlgre LTarly UwWCITIIIlgS (COWHIIousSTS/) -
fa) T e . fa) fal e fa Vol Be W Wit W] ol o KR co1 : 12
U.0.20 Tro, cliapcter 7 OCCCIOIT U7 +0.2.-9 I amenoeT to aoud tlilie TOLTOWIIg . Ui TIice
= N K11 : T} KPR 1] k] . lo k] A = ] k] 132 1
oIreT—arcer CIrc wWoIrT oCcTuparcres [c3viws JITC . aT  cacrea . orre aITa . CwWo— Lammrty GOwerLIirg [=333w
R | : 3 = ] k] i = 1o N1}
mMUorcrprec SIlgre LTarly UwCITIIIlgS (COWHIIouSTS/) - }

6.6.[2F]20 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 907.[26]9.5, Maintenance, inspection and
testing is amended to add the following sentences at the end of the section: Increases in




nuisance alarms shall require the fire alarm system to be tested for sensitivity. Fire
alarm systems that continue after sensitivity testing with unwarranted nuisance alarms
shall be replaced as directed by the AHJ.

6.6.21 IFC, Chapter 9, Section 907.10, Carbon monoxide alarms is created as

follows: Carbon monoxide alarms shall be installed on each habitable level of a

dwelling unit or sleeping unit in Groups R-2, R-3, R-4, and I-1 equipped with fuel

burning appliances.

6.6.21.1 If more than one Carbon monoxide detector is required they shall be

interconnected as required in IFC, Chapter 9, Section 907.2.11.3.

6.6.21.2 In new construction, carbon monoxide detectors shall receive their

primary power as required in IFC, Chapter 9, Section 907.2.11.4.

6.6.21.3 Upon completion of the installation, the carbon monoxide detector

system will meet the requirements listed in NFPA 720, Installation of Carbon Monoxide

Detection and Warning Egquipment and UL2034, Standard for Single and Multiple Station

Carbon Monoxide Alarms.

6.7 International Fire Code - Means of Egress
6.7.1 IFC, Chapter 10, Section 1008.1.[83]19.6, Special locking arrangements in
Group I-2 is amended [to—add—tihe—fottowing] as follows:

6.7.1.1 c n : ] 1 T 0 : 1 ) R : 3 R} =
/ol J. DOOUrS Iir oroup T T Jdira T OCTUpParIcresS, wilcrc Clle CIIIrrcar rreca OT

) e i : L. W] 3 e = ) : o 3
CIIC pPAaCIclIItS Trogurre  sSpecrarrzea sScocourrroy nmeasurcecs Tor crrcrr SAarLCCyYr JPProvet  acCtTSS

- 13 R} 1 : — ] 1 13 =B : i s .
CONTrorred C©ogresSs may ©OT  IfIsStarreca WwieIr ar L  Cle IOTITOWINg arc LLICL,.] The section title

“Special locking arrangements in Group I-2.” is rewritten to read “Special locking

arrangements in Groups I-1 and I-2.”

6.7.1 [H]2 [V"\rrﬂ = 13 K] ] i) 13 k] 1 i i NS}
P 0 Z I L I COnItrorrea ©gre TOOTS TaTr T UIrrTOCK OpoIT actrIvacrIolr o Cre

. . Wagil . | . =l . N — 1 . . A .
aUuTtomaTtIrC I Ire SPprImrrer—SySTem OrCTie automatrc I Irre aeTtecCTtIon D_YDL,CLH-] On line three,

after the word “Group”, add the words “I-1 and”.

6.7.1 [3 2]3 [V"‘lrrﬂ = . o 3 1 ) i 13 3 3 1
/el 0 2 [oary IS TacITICy oSCtarrL Cdall UIIroCcK ClIe COIICrorrecd C©gress uoors Oy

etther—sensor—or—%keypad- On line two and line four delete the word “delayed” and replace
it with the word “controlled”.

6.7.1.[1.3]£ [5.3 Fhe—controtted TOTITTSS gdoors—shatt—untock TpPOIT toss—of J_JUWCJ.-]

Beginning on line 11, the entire sentence that begins with “A building occupant” is
deleted.

6.7.1.[+4—5—%415 After existing Item 6 add a new Item 7 as follows: 7. The
secure area or unit with controlled egress doors shall be located at the level of exit

discharge in Type V construction.

6.7 2 o : ] 3 fo) : 1 ) R : 3 R} =
e T. DOOULr TIIT oroup L L Jalrcar T OCTUpPaITIcTeS, WIlcTre ClIc CcIrIfrrcart lececa OT

) e i : R} I e 3 1o ] k] ] ) 1 e R ) : I T | R}
CIIC  pPAacIclIc TeOgurre approved,; IIstedua toclayced Cgogress ITOCKSy CIICY TarT  poT TIlhscarrcoca  olr

doors—as—attowed—in] IFC, Chapter 10, Section 1008.1.[8+6=]19.7, Delaved egress locks is

amended to add a new Item 7 after the existing Item 6 as follows: 7. The secure area or

unit with delayed egress locks shall be located at the level of exit discharge in Type V
construction.

6.7.[2]3 IFC, Chapter 10, Section 1009.[3]4.2, Riser height and tread depth is
amended as follows: On line [fifve] six of Exception [4]5 delete "[F#7#5] 734 inches
(197mm) " and replace it with "8 inches". On line seven of Exception [4]5 delete "10
inches (254mm)" and replace it with "9 inches".

6.7.[314 IFC, Chapter 10, Section 1009.[*+6]12, Handrails is amended to add the
following exception: 6. In occupancies in Group R-3, as applicable in Section 101.2 and

in occupancies in Group U, which are accessory to an occupancy in Group R-3, as
applicable in Section 101.2, handrails shall be provided on at least one side of
stairways consisting of four or more risers.

e B T =) . 10 Il g At Me W : Ioal = Il i) a1 3
[w. T T 7 ITgpter TU7 OCCTTIOT TUTZO s amenoea CO aercr CITe TOTTOWITIO™
m g N s 1 1 K] | 3 : I ema ] k1 T R R
X CCPTIO  NOIT—CTIrrcurar [anararrs ScrvIiinng alr rnarvIaguar dirrtc il a oroup K1, Oroup v OT
R L s e . i) 1 2 1 e alal R sl
STroup o ocCTuUparncy  WICtIr o poerrimecter  Jgreacer Ccialr o T IIICIITS {TovmitSTIartr  proviac o
1o = lo o] LR W) £ my = R e R 3
grasSpaoTre rInger recesSS arca ofr OOTIT ERviS) O Tl prorrres IS TCINngerrecesSs TarT OoTgTIT
LR 1t e £ 3 3 1 (10 k] ] 17 = = 1] - g =S
WITIITIT a Jarscallce oL -7 IfIciT (Lo measurea TrTIcarry L Iom CIiIT CtarfrcST pPpoOrctroir oOr CTIire
= 1 PR )

=] 3 1o 3 L) a : 1 Q R 2/ 2 b} yRaYo) 1 3 i)
ProrrrIrT aIta aclrreve o CcCpCcll OL at rodst J7 o IIICITr (o) WICIrrir 77 O  IIIcIr \ ) OCTOwW  ClIic



sl = A = =i Ml o : R RN I | A = a7 /0 o 1o
WICCSCT pPOrCIOIl OL Cllc Prorrres ITITTrS rocgurrea ocptlir Siiart cofrcriroe ror ac rftedasct o7 o rlrctr

a0 = 3 T P S | TR N 13 : 1o AL N k] N | = A =
T Oty CO o Ifover Cclract IS ot eSS crratr = T IHCIICS (I  PCeITOoOwW Clle CalleosC porcroir or
N =] Mia : : (R P =N 1o k] ] k) N R e T ] : 1o
ClIC prorrro. TIre mrrirrmainr wIcacir oL Clic  larncrarrt apoove Clie  reccecesSS Strart OT T T LTIICIITS

2 i : £ 0 3 : lo o0 Il R e T N : : 1 N o A | : 1o
oz CoO a maxXImanr Or T IIcrre 7 o) TOgTS TTarT L [Iave o mrirrmnan racro oL U.UL IlrcIr

0=25mm—]

6.7.5 IFC, Chapter 10, Section 1013.2, Height is amended to add the following
exception: [3]5. For occupancies in Group R-3 and within individual dwelling units in
occupancies in Group R-2, as applicable in Section 101.2, guards shall form a protective
barrier not less than 36 inches (914mm) .

6.7.6 IFC, Chapter 10, Section 1015.2.2, Three or more exits or exit access

doorways is amended to add the following sentence at the end of the section: Additional
exits or exit access doorways shall be arranged a reasonable distance apart so that if
one becomes blocked, the others will be available.

6.7.7 IFC, Chapter 10, Section 1024, Luminous Egress Path Markings is deleted in
its entirety.

6.7.[#]8 1IFC, Chapter 10, Section [+628=2] 1030.2, Reliability is amended to add
the following: On line six after the word "fire" add the words "and building".

6.8 International Fire Code - Explosives and Fireworks

6.8.1 IFC, Chapter 33, Section 3301.1.3, Fireworks, Exception 4 is amended to add
the following sentence at the end of the exception: The use of fireworks for display and
retail sales is allowed as set forth in UCA 53-7-220, [&fd] UCA 11-3-1, UAC R710-2, and
this rule.

Qo T Ala = 20 a — 2200 149 o e a1 e k] =
[U.U. TrC, Cllapter JOJ7; SCCCIOIl OJOU0. T IS— o IITwW ScCCIoll S TOLIOWS. DISpTray ot
el V) e 1 k] : s s F=) (i I = P R o " o
TASS © COMIMOIT STCAacte approved CXPIrosSIves ISrIoc oL PDurrarlirg ProctecteT crrougroguc wr ol atr
= e =i R . | " L " 1 o = F=R N £ L —
gucomacrc rrrc SpPrIfrRrcr CCIt  SiIar L 11Ot CXCTTT I pPCorCTIIt oL Ctllc arca or clie rocarx
O
Q1 bk pal Ala = 20 a — 20N 19 o 4 a1 e 1 =
U+ 0.0 T Ty, CllgpCter JOJ7y OCCCIOIl OJU0.TO IS o fIew CTCCIOIT a5 IOLIIOWS. DISPpTIay oL
el V) e k] k] : : : o (i I 4 = NI Pl
TS T COMMoIT  State approvea cCXProsSIves Tflsruc oL Purrcarigs 1ot procceccctea  wrclr  alr
= e y=Xi R . | = L . 1 1oC k] = = oot iy
gurtomacrc rIrc SPIrIIRICTT SyoScolr Sliarr ot T©XCTTa 1zZ2J poulcsS oL pylrocteclinirc CoOmMpoSTICTCIOoIr.

Lla N = 3 LD NN = lose o s 2 : PR o0 = =N
WIITTT Cllc dactuarl WwWorgllt OL Clle PYyIrOCCCIHIITC COMPUSTICIOIr IS ITOC RITOWIT, J_ pcorceirc or  clc
.

3 orlorde = £ k] : k] 1 k] s G e B I B 1
JroSS— wWeIglltc oL Clle CcoIsumer T IrTewoOrRsS, Iicrudarllyg pPacRagrlilg, oSiiart Do porircecea to oo
A Jorde 3 o 3 eclod el . oot Py
USTCT CO CCCoTrlire ClIc wWoIgllit O ClT PYyIrOCCCHIITC COMpPOSTCIOINT.
Q4 T Ala = 23 o — 223na a4 o e a1 e 1 =
U. 0.9 T T, Cllgprter JJ70CCCTIOIl JOJOU0.IT3® IS o oW ScCCIoll a5 TLOILIToOwS. DIsSpra OT
el V) 1= 1 1 fo

. k] 3 : : (] =) s I | = : =
TaSS © COMIMolIT SCtAate approved CXProsSIves Illsrouc oL PDUurlarligs Siart ot c©Xceecda a Ierglrc

grester—tharsixfeet—above—thefioor—surface~r

(o} I T I ok e 20 fal s isEoNa¥e) e I . . £ 11 n il e
U e O« J Ty \_/J.J.C{)_JL_CJ_ 97 O T TTITUIT JIU0 . T J T o ITTW o C C TITUIT as TUTTUWS . INAaCTR DL_UJ_C{\;’C
£ ol Fal e e | 1 . . A | £ 1 a1l ol o . loa oo L |
U TaoS S O CUNMNNNMUIT STattT™ C{l—/l—/J_U A=A I PJ.UDJ. A=1=) TITSTUT UL uu;;u;ngb S )_JJ_UJ.J.J_L_)J_ L_C\_A..}
6.9 International Fire Code - Flammable and Combustible Liquids

6.9.1 IFC, Chapter 34, Section 3401.4, Permits is amended to add the following at
the end of the section: The owner of an underground tank that is out of service for
longer than one year, shall receive a Temporary Closure Notice from the Department of
Environmental Quality and a copy shall be given to the AHJ.

Q2 T Ala = 24 a — 240C C o Jol ot adl k] . a1
[U. - TrC, CllgpCter J4y SCCCIOll JO49UJ.J.1L IS Cvcrcrted dalia rewrrccoell S LTOIITOWS.
yal s s ——1 1 s Tl 13 IR R s 1 loe 1 1 1 1
Orrraor IlIlSCtarllaCcrolls . WIITre wall moullited Urspoliscr CONCarIlIIrilg arcoltor oasca atc ruos
s P | 1o (| o R B B 3 k] L N 17 F=R N a1 s
arc rirscarrcoca  rilr corrraors,  cre STIarr T Il agccordalice wrctll art or Cllc TLTOIToOwINng. =T.
T 1 T 12 1 —— R | 1 17 R s 2 mi. :
TevVe T g Do ve Ll O acrosSorl COIICarlilers Tar L ot DT arrtowca Il CoOrrroors-. T Ll maXTrar
. = o1 T Fr . (DR} 1. G e 47 AL N 3
CapacTIty ©OL c<aclr CIassS T O I ITIgurdas CUrspellscer Siartl Dbo 3L oullces Jalica  cllic  maxiain
. = T R 1 " LI B 10 2 mi. 3 —
CapacTIty OL cTacll oovel T acrosSor CUrsSpelrsctr Sirart T To oullceS. O IlIT maXTmalr gudllicIcy
17 3 - (] R T 4 k] el 1 1 1N 17 £ o~ T T
aTrrowca Il a COoOrrraor WwWICIHIIT & COIItror group arca siartrt bo 1Tu gartolrs oL Ccrass T or Tt
1. s 11 aC £ T kI 1 los 4 £ o~ T T 1. (| 3
TIguIcas oL ITroJ oullcT OL LCovel I acrosSorT O & CcomoIiractIolr oL oI T Or ITI ITrIgurc oI
k1 4 lo = Fa 17 4 kY . —
T U gar oIS, T. [ TOJCCCIOIIS

T T k1 = NI N B : k] =
TCVeTL I JdcroSUrsS ITOC CtO C©XCTTT Il rtotarl Ctlile cgurvarcliitc o
lo

et s R i 3 k] e ] 1Ana o o
TITCO & COrrraor Slrarr DT Il aCcCoOraallct WICIT oCCCIOoll TUUo.0.0-.

6.9.[3]2 IFC, Chapter 34, Section 3406.1, General is amended to add the following
special operation: 8. Sites approved by the AHJ.

6.9.[%#]3 1IFC, Chapter 34, Section 3406.2, Storage and dispensing of flammable and
combustible ligquids on farms and construction sites is amended to add the following: On




line five after the words “borrow pits” add the words “and sites approved by the AHJ”.
6.10 International Fire Code - Liquefied Petroleum Gas
6.10.1 TIFC, Chapter 38, Section 3809.12, Location of storage outside of buildings
is amended as follows: In Table 3809.12, Doorway or opening to a building with two or

more means of egress, with regard to quantities 720 or less and 721 - 2,500, the
currently stated “5” is deleted and replaced with “10”.

[ a0 (] T I ol . 20 o g 2000 a1 A4 »- | ul £ 11 hmY il e [aWal £

OU. LU . Ty ullale.CJ. 07 O C C TITUIT JOU . L1 E. dIITUTU TUTTUWS . DTTITTCT ) LT U

12 N k] 3 s R S e
TIIIC ClIree dalia roprace It wrclir J_U.}

6.11 TIFC, Chapter 47, Referenced Standards is amended as follows:

6.11.1 Under the heading NFPA - National Fire Protection Association, add NFPA
720, Installation of Carbon Monoxide (CO) Detection and Warning Equipment, 2009 edition.

6.11.2 Under the heading UL - Underwriters Laboratories, Inc. add UL2034,
Standard for Single and Multiple Station Carbon Monoxide Alarms, 1998.

6.[**]112 National Fire Protection Association — NFPA 72 National Fire Alarm Code

6.[**]112.1 NFPA 72, Chapter 2, Section 2.2, NFPA Publications is amended to add
the following NFPA standard: NFPA 20, Standard for the Installation of Stationary Pumps
for Fire Protection, 2007 edition.

6.[FF]112.2 NFPA 72, Chapter 4, Section 4.3.2 System Designer, Subsection
4.3.2.2(2) 1is deleted and rewritten as follows: National Institute of Certification in

Engineering Technologies (NICET) fire alarm level II certified personnel.
6.[F%]112.3 NFPA 72, Chapter 4, Section 4.3.3 System Installer, Subsection
4.3.3(2)1is deleted and rewritten as follows: National Institute of Certification in

Engineering Technologies (NICET) fire alarm level II certified personnel.
6.[FF]112.4 NFPA 72, Chapter 4, Section 4.4.3.7 Alarm Signal Deactivation,
Subsection 4.4.3.7.2 is amended to add the following sentence: When approved by the AHJ,

the audible notification appliances may be deactivated during the investigation mode to
prevent unauthorized reentry into the building.

6.[**]112.5 NFPA 72, Chapter 4, Section 4.4.5 Protection of Fire Alarm System is
deleted in its entirety and rewritten as follows: Automatic smoke detection shall be

provided at the location of each fire alarm control unit(s), notification appliance
circuit power extenders, and supervising station transmitting equipment to provide
notification of fire at the location.

6.[F%]112.5.1 NFPA 72, Chapter 4, Section 4.4.5, Exception No. 1 is added as
follows: When ambient conditions prohibit installation of automatic smoke detection,
automatic heat detection shall be permitted.

6.[**]112.6 NFPA 72, Chapter 6, Section 6.8.5.9 Signal Initiation — Fire Pump is
amended to add the following subsection: 6.8.5.9.3 Automatic fire pumps shall be

supervised in accordance with NFPA 20, Standard for the Installation of Stationary Pumps
for Fire Protection, and the AHJ.
6.[FF112.7 NFPA 72, Chapter 7, Section 7.4.1 General Requirements, Subsection

7.4.1.2 1is amended as follows: On 1line three delete “110dBA” and replace it with
“120dBA”.

6.[F%]112.8 NFPA 72, Chapter 8, Section 8.3.4 TIndication of Central Station
Service, Subsection 8.3.4.7 1is amended as follows: On 1line two, after the word

“notified” insert the words “without delay”.
6.[*%]112.9 NFPA 72, Chapter 10, Section 10.2.2.5 Service Personnel Qualifications
and Experience, Subsection 10.2.2.5.1 1is deleted and rewritten as follows: Service

personnel shall be qualified and experienced in the inspection, testing and maintenance
of fire alarm systems. Qualified personnel shall meet the certification requirements
stated in [Yteh—Admimntstreative—€ode;] UAC R710-11-3, Fire Alarm System Inspecting and
Testing.

6.13 National Fire Protection Association — NEFPA 1124 Manufacture,

Transportation, Storage and Retail Sales of Fireworks and Pyrotechnic Articles
6.13.1 NFPA 1124, Chapter 7, Section 7.2 Special Limits for Retail Sales of
Consumer Fireworks, Subsection 7.2.8 is added as a new subsection as follows: Display

of Class C common state approved explosives inside of buildings protected throughout




with an automatic fire sprinkler system shall not exceed 25 percent of the area of the

retail sales floor or exceed 600 square feet, whichever is less.
6.13.2 NFPA 1124, Chapter 7, Section 7.2 Special Limits for Retail Sales of
Consumer Fireworks, Subsection 7.2.9 is added as a new subsection as follows: Rack

storage of Class C common state approved explosives inside of buildings is prohibited.
6.13.3 NFPA 1124, Chapter 7, Section 7.3.1 Exempt Amounts, Subsection 7.3.1.1 is
deleted and rewritten as follows: Display of Class C common state approved explosives

inside of buildings not protected with an automatic fire sprinkler system shall not

exceed 125 pounds of pyrotechnic composition.

6.13.4 NFPA 1124, Chapter 7, Section 7.3.15.2 Height of Sales Displays, Subsection
7.3.15.2.2 is amended to read as follows: On line three delete “12 ft (3.66m)” and
replace it with “6 ft”.

R710-9-7. Fire Advisory and Code Analysis Committee.

7.1 There is created by the Board a Fire Advisory and Code Analysis Committee
whose duties are to provide direction to the Board in the matters of fire prevention and
building codes.

7.2 The committee shall serve in an advisory position to the Board, members shall
be appointed by the Board, shall serve for a term of three years, and shall consist of
the following members:

7.2.1 A representative from the State Fire Marshal's Office.

7.2.2 The Code Committee Chairman of the Fire Marshal's Association of Utah.

7.2.3 A fire marshal or fire inspector from a local fire department or fire
district.

7.2.4 A representative from the Department of Health.

7.2.5 The Chief Elevator Inspector from the Utah Labor Commission.

6111161 A representative from the Department of Human Services.

7.2.7 A representative from Forestry, Fire and State Lands.

7.3 This committee shall join together with the Uniform Building Code Commission
Fire Protection Advisory Committee to form the Unified Code Analysis Council.

7.4 The Council shall meet as directed by the Board or as directed by the
Building Codes Commission or as needed to review fire prevention and building code issues
that require definitive and specific analysis.

7.5 The Council shall select one of it's members to act in the position of chair
and another to act as vice chair. The chair and vice chair shall serve for one year
terms on a calendar year basis. Elections for chair and vice chair shall occur at the
meeting conducted in the last quarter of the calendar year.

7.6 The chair or vice chair of the council shall report to the Board or Building
Codes Commission recommendations of the Council with regard to the review of fire and
building codes.

R710-9-8. Enforcement of the Rules of the State Fire Marshal.

8.1 Fire and 1life safety plan reviews of new construction, additions, and
remodels of state owned facilities shall be conducted by the SFM, or his authorized
deputies. State owned facilities shall be inspected by the SFM, or his authorized
deputies.

8.2 Fire and life safety plan reviews of new construction, additions, and

remodels of public and private schools shall be completed by the SFM, or his authorized
deputies, and the LFA.

8.3 Fire and 1life safety plan reviews of new construction, additions, and
remodels of publicly owned buildings, privately owned colleges and universities, and
institutional occupancies, with the exception of state owned buildings, shall be
completed by the LFA. If not completed by the LFA, the SFM, or his authorized deputies
shall complete the plan review.

8.4 The following listed occupancies shall be inspected by the LFA. If not
completed by the LFA, the SFM, or his authorized deputies shall inspect.



8.4.1 Publicly owned buildings other than state owned buildings as referenced in
9.1 of this rule.

8.4.2 Public and private schools.

8.4.3 Privately owned colleges and universities.

8.4.4 Institutional occupancies as defined in Section 9-2 of this rule.
8.4.5 Places of assembly as defined in Section 9-2 of this rule.

8.5 The Board shall require prior to approval of a grant the following:

8.5.1 That the applying fire agency be actively participating in the statewide
fire statistics reporting program.

8.5.2 The Board shall also require that the applying fire agency be actively
working towards structural or wildland firefighter certification through the Utah Fire
Service Certification System.

R710-9-9. Fire Prevention Board Budget and Amendment Sub-Committees.

9.1 There is created two Fire Prevention Board Sub-Committees known as the Budget
Subcommittee and the Amendment Subcommittee. The subcommittees membership shall be
appointed from members of the Board.

9.2 Membership on the Sub-Committee shall be by appointment of the Board Chair or
as volunteered by Board members. Membership on the Sub-Committee shall be limited to
four Board members.

9.3 The Sub-Committee shall meet as necessary and shall vote and appoint a chair
to represent the Sub-Committee at regularly scheduled Board meetings.

R710-9-10. Repeal of Conflicting Board Actions.
All former Board actions, or parts thereof, conflicting or inconsistent with the
provisions of this Board action or of the codes hereby adopted, are hereby repealed.

R710-9-11. Validity.

The Utah Fire Prevention Board hereby declares that should any section, paragraph,
sentence, or word of this Board action, or of the codes hereby adopted, be declared
invalid, it is the intent of the Utah Fire Prevention Board that it would have passed all
other portions of this action, independent of the elimination of any portion as may be
declared invalid.

R710-9-12. Adjudicative Proceedings.

12.1 All adjudicative proceedings performed by the agency shall proceed
informally as set forth herein and as authorized by UCA, Sections 63G-4-202 and 63G-4-
203.

12.2 1If a city, county, or fire protection district refuses to establish a method
of appeal regarding a portion of the IFC, the appealing party may petition the Board to
act as the board of appeals.

12.3 A person may request a hearing on a decision made by the SFM, his authorized
deputies, or the LFA, by filing an appeal to the Board within 20 days after receiving
final decision.

12.4 All adjudicative proceedings, other than criminal prosecution, taken by the
SFM, his authorized deputies, or the LFA, to enforce the Utah Fire Prevention and Safety
Act and these rules, shall commence in accordance with UCA, Section 63G-4-201.

12.5 The Board shall act as the hearing authority, and shall convene as an
appeals board after timely notice to all parties involved.

12.6 The Board shall direct the SFM to issue a signed order to the parties
involved giving the decision of the Board within a reasonable time of the hearing
pursuant to UCA, Section 63G-4-203.

12.7 Reconsideration of the Board's decision may be requested in writing within
20 days of the date of the decision pursuant to UCA, Section 63G-4-302.

12.8 Judicial review of all final Board actions resulting from informal
adjudicative proceedings is available pursuant to UCA, Section 63G-4-402.



KEY: fire prevention, law

Date of Enactment or Last Substantive Amendment: [May—27—2669]
Notice of Continuation: June 12, 2002

Authorizing, and Implemented or Interpreted Law: 53-7-204



